
1111 W~ ~~,.~.~~11.\MLI'M Wl~L U!II.MLit'o~'~~·i IIIII 
Reception#: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean Alberico 
1 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

STATE OF COLORADO ) 
)ss 

County of Garfield ) 

At a regular meeting of the Board of County Commissioners for Garfield County, Colorado, 
held at the Commissioners' Meeting Room at the Garfield County Courthouse in Glenwood 
Springs on the July 2, 2012 there were present: 

-"J-"ohn~M"""art,_,.in.__ __________ , Commission Chairman 
_.T .... o,.m..,J"'ank=o"-'v'-"s""kv.~--________ _,, Commissioner 
"'Mi""·,.ke"-"'Sam..,...s.,.o,.,n'---------------' Commissioner 

-"An=""dre"-""w'-'--"G"'o""'rg.,e<.Ly __________ , County Manager 
,C""ar..,e<.Ly_,Gagn.,.,...,o"'n.__ _________ __,., Acting County Attorney 

_,J"'ean"""'AI"""b"'en!..!· c"'-'o!..-__________ , Clerk of the Board 

when the following proceedings, among others were had and done, to-wit: 

RESOLUTION NO. 2012- 51 
RESOLUTION CONCERNED WITH THE AMENDMENT OF RESOLUTION 2010-25, 
REGULATION OF FUTURE CONSTRUCTION AND ALTERATIONS OF DWELLINGS, 
BUILDINGS, AND STRUCTURES, TOGETHER WITH PLUMBING AND ELECTRICAL 
INSTALLATIONS THEREIN, OR IN CONNECTION THEREWITH, AND THE ADOPTION 
OF PORTIONS OF THE FOLLOWING CODES: 2009 INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE 
(IBC), 2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE (IRC), 2009 INTERNATIONAL 
MECHANICAL CODE (IMC), 2009 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE (IPC), 2009 
INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE (IFGC) and the 2009 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY 
CONSERVATION CODE (IECC). 

WHEREAS, Garfield County, Colorado, is a legal and political subdivision of the State 
of Colorado, and is organized pursuant to the Constitution and Laws of the State of Colorado; 

WHEREAS, pursuant to Section 30-28-204, C.R.S. 1973, as amended, the Board of 
County Commissioners of Garfield County, Colorado, is authorized to amend an adopted 
Building Code for the unincorporated areas of Garfield County; 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Garfield County, Colorado, did on 
March 1, 2010 duly adopt and enact the Garfield County Building Code of2010, Resolution 
2010-25, providing for the regulation of construction or alteration of dwellings, buildings, and 
structures, together with plumbing and electrical installations therein, or in connection therewith; 

WHEREAS, the General Assembly of the State of Colorado enacted certain energy 
conservation standards for the construction of residential and non-residential structures under 
Colorado Revised Statues 30-28-211, which requires every board of county commissioners that 

l 



1111 WJI".~r~11.~,\WIRM,~.~. W\1.1,\'!'fr.~"' IIIII 
Reception#: 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 ~M Jean Alberico 
2 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fae:0.00 GARFIElD COUNTY CO 

has adopted a building code to adopt an energy conservation code; 

WHEREAS, on March 13,2012 a work session was held with the Board of County 
Commissioners of Garfield County, concerned citizens and local fire districts to discuss fire 
sprinkler requirements under the 2009 IRC; 

WHEREAS, a public hearing was held before the Board of County Commissioners of 
Garfield County, Colorado, on July 2, 2012 at the Garfield County Commissioners' Hearing 
Room, 108 8th Street, Glenwood Springs, Colorado, at which time and place, the public was 
invited to make statements for or against amending the existing building codes adopted under 
Resolution 2010-25 to delete fire sprinkler requirements for the 2009 IRC; 

WHEREAS, the above public hearing was duly advertised in accordance with Colorado 
Revised Statute 30-28-204 at least 14 days prior to the public hearing; 

WHEREAS, at the above public hearing on July 2, 2012 the Board of County 
Commissioners of Garfield County did approve amendments to delete the fire sprinkler 
requirements for the 2009 IRC; 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Garfield Comity, hereby finds that 
adoption of the proposed Building Code is in accordance with public health, safety, morals and 
general welfare and safety, protection and sanitation of such dwellings, buildings and structures, 
in the unincorporated areas of Garfield County; 

WHEREAS, the Board of County Commissioners of Garfield County, Colorado, 
determines that all previous building codes of the County should be repealed and a new Code be 
adopted. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of County Commissioners of 
Garfield County, Colorado, that the following be and hereby is adopted and enacted pursuant to 
Title 30, Article 28 of the Colorado Revised Statutes of 1973, as amended, as the Garfield 
County Building Code Resolution of2012. 

SECTION I-TITLE 
The resolution may be cited for all purposes as the "Garfield County Building Code 

Resolution of2012", and may be referred to herein as "this Resolution." This Resolution shall 
include those codes set forth below as adopted by reference with amendments. 

SECTION II-PURPOSE 
The provisions of this Resolution are made with a reasonable consideration of, and in 

accordance with a plan designed to promote the public health, safety, morals and general welfare, 
and the safety, protection, and sanitation of the dwellings, buildings, structures, and equipment, 
regulated hereby in Garfield County, Colorado. 

2 



SECTION III-SCOPE 
The provisions of this Resolution shall apply to the future construction or alteration of all 

dwellings, buildings, and structures in the entire unincorporated area of Garfield County, 
Colorado together with plwnbing, mechanical, and electrical installations therein or in 
connection therewith. Buildings or structures used for the sole purpose of providing shelter for 
agricultural implements, farm products, livestock, or poultry shall be exempted from regulations 
under this Resolution. Where in any specific case, different sections of this Resolution, the 
Zoning Resolution or other resolutions of Garfield County or other govermnental body specify 
different requirements, the most restrictive shall govern. 

SECTION IV -ADOPTION OF INTERNATIONAL CODES 

The Board of County Commissioners adopts by reference all of the provisions of the 2009 
International Building Code (IBC), 2009 International Residential Code (IRC), 2009 
International Mechanical Code (IMC), 2009 International Plwnbing Code (IPC), the 2009 
International Fuel Gas Code (IFGC), and the 2009 International Energy Conservation Code 
(IECC) except to the extent modified and amended and herby adopted as set forth in Exhibit "A" 
attached hereto and incorporated by this reference. The above-referenced International Codes, 
collectively, shall be referred to and known as the "Garfield County Building Code of2012." 
Fees related to permits are outlined in Exhibit "B" attached hereto and incorporated by this 
reference and are hereby adopted. 

SECTION V -REPEAL OF PRIOR CODE 

The Board of County Commissioners herby repeals the Garfield County Building Code of 
2010 as adopted in Resolution 2010-25. 

SECTION V- EFFECTIVE DATE 

This Resolution shall become effective on the 1st day of September 2012, and all Building 
Permit Applications submitted on or after the effective date shall be subject to all of the 
provisions of this resolution, including but not limited to any fee schedule changes. 

Dated this I (p-t.:!:: day of J ~,A.D. 2012. 

ATTEST: GARFIELD COUNTY BOARD OF 
COMMISSIONERS GARFIELD COUNTY, 
COLO 0 

Upon motion duly made and seconded the foregoing Resolution was adopted by the following 

3 



~~~~tf!~~~~~lfk rto~ll!l& ti\I.IW ~·~~~~r~~~ IIIII 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
4 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

vote: 

Chairman Martin Aye 
Commissioner Jankovsky Aye 
Commissioner Samson Nay 

STATEOFCOLORADO ) 
)ss 

County of Garfield ) 

I, County Clerk and ex-officio Clerk of the Board of County 
Commissioners in and for the County and State aforesaid do hereby certify that the annexed and 
foregoing Resolution is truly copied from the Records of the Proceedings of the Board of County 
Commissioners for said Garfield County, now in my office. 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto set my hand and affixed the seal of said County, at 
Glenwood Springs, this __ day of , A.D. 2012 

County Clerk and ex-officio Clerk of the Board of County Commissioners 

4 



•m Rrolo P;L"9,rtt,~P ·~IWP N.ll!lll,ri\l,l'ln'llllr'A'IW' ~~~~ IIIII 
Rocept1on~: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean ~lberioo 
5 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

Exhibit A- Alteration to International Codes 

I. RULES OF CONSTRUCTION 

A. Appendices and Tables 

Adoption by reference of the below stated Codes shall include the appendices published in each 
Code volume as specifically listed in this document. 

B. Substitution of Terminology 

Wherever the word "ordinance" appears in the adopted Codes the word "resolution" shall be 
substituted therefore; similarly, the word "County" shall be substituted for "City" or 
"Municipality"; "Board of County Commissioners of Garfield County, Colorado" shall be 
substituted for "City Council", "appointing authority", "chief appointing authority of the 
municipality", and Director of Public Works"; "County Building Official" shall be substituted 
for "Administrative Authority"; and "Board of Review" shall be substituted for "Board of 
Appeals". In any case, the International Codes adopted herein shall be read and construed in 
the context of application to a County factual situation. 

II. 2009 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE FOR ONE- AND TWO-F AMlL Y 
DWELLINGS (I.R.C.) 

A. Additions and Modifications: The Sections of the I.R.C. are adopted subject to the following 
additions or modifications: 

I. Section RlOI.l is amended to read as follows: 

RlOl.l Title. This code shall be known as the Residential Code for One- and Two
Family Dwellings of Garfield County, Colorado. 1bis code shall apply to all of the 
unincorporated area of Garfield County, Colorado 

2. Section Rl02.7 is amended to read as follows (Section R102.7.1 remains as 
written): 

R102.7 Existing structures. The legal occupancy of any structure existing on the date 
of adoption of this code shall be permitted to continue without change, except as is 
specifically covered in this code, the International Fire Code or as is deemed necessary 
by the building official for the general safety and welfare of the occupants and the 
public. 

3. Section R104.1 is amended to read as follows: 

R104.1 General. The Building Official is hereby authorized and directed to enforce all 

5 



1111 Ml".~o~l~.~~~llll~llf'u,M~.~ ~~ll"r~W.~·~ IIIII 
Reception"; 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
6 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Ooo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

of the provision of this code; however, a guarantee that all building and structures have 
been constructed in accordance with all of the provisions of this code is neither intended 
nor implied. The Building Official shall have the authority to render interpretations of 
this code and to adopt policies and procedures in order to clarify the application of its 
provisions. Such interpretations, policies and procedures shall be in conformance with 
the intent and purpose of this code. Such policies and procedures shall not have the 
effect of waiving requirements specifically provided for in this code. 

4. Section Rl 04.8 is amended to read as follows: 

R104.8 Liability. The adoption of this code, and any previous codes adopted by 
Garfield County, shall not be deemed to give rise to a duty of care on the part of any 
public entity, public employee or agent, nor shall this code or any previous codes be 
deemed to create any civil remedy against a public entity, public employee or agent. 
The building official, member of the board of review or employee charged with the 
enforcement of this code, while acting for the jurisdiction in good faith and without 
malice in the discharge of the duties required by this code or other law or ordinance, 
shall not thereby be rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from personal 
liability for any damage accruing to persons or property as a result of any act or by 
reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit instituted 
against an officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or employee 
in the lawful discharge of duties and under the provisions of this code shall be defended 
by legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings. 
The building official or any subordinate, acting in good faith, shall not be liable for cost 
in any action, suit or proceeding that is instituted io pursuance of the provisions of this 
code. 

5. Section Rl05.1 is amended to add the following subsections: 

R105.1.1 Reroofing permit. A permit is required to reroof a residence. 

6. Section R105.2 is amended to read as follows: 

R105.2 Work exempt from permit. Permits shall not be required for the following. 
Exemption from the permit requirements of this code shall not be deemed to grant 
authorization for any work to be done in any manner in violation of the provisions of 
this code or any other laws or ordinances of this jurisdiction. 

a. One-story detached accessory structures used as a tool and storage sheds or 
playhouses, provided the floor area does not exceed 200 square feet. 

b. Fences not over 6 feet high used for non-agricultural uses and any fence built for 
agricultural purposes that is a post and wire construction. 

c. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet io height measured from the bottom of 
the footing to the top of the wall, uuless supporting a surcharge. 

6 



Ill/ fro~. ~l~,~,\~,11~~.1\/t IP\! lj,ll ~~~~~It\&',~'" IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28~44 AM Je•n Alberico 
7 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GRRFI~LO COUNTY CO 

d. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 
gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to I. 

e. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish 
work. 

f. Prefabricated swimming pools that are less than 24 inches deep. 
g. Swings and other playground equipment. 
h. Window awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more 

than 54 inches from the exterior wall and do not require additional 
support. 

i. Recreational cabins as defined herein. 
J. Decks that are not more than 30 inches above grade at any point. 
k. Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches above the adjacent 

grade, and not over any basement or story below and are not part of a 
accessible route. 

I. Individual mechanical, electrical, or gas work not included in a building 
permit.. 

m. Covered porches, roof structures and patio covers less than 10 feet in depth 
and/or less than 200 square feet in area and the walking surface is less than 30 
inches to grade. 

7. Section Rl 05.5 is amended to read as follows: 

R105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions 
of this code shall expire by limitation and become null and void if the building or work 
authorized by such permit is not commenced within 180 days from the date of such 
permit, or if the building or work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned 
at any time after the work is commenced for a period of 180 days. Permits must pass a 
required inspection during every 180 day period after each inspection in order not to be 
considered suspended or abandoned. On expired permits, before such work can be 
recommenced, a re-issued or new permit shall be obtained. The fee for a re-issued or 
new permit shall be one-half the permit fee of the original permit, provided no changes 
have been made in the original plans and specifications for such work, and further 
provided that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. Changes in 
plans and specifications shall require an additional permit fee and plan review fee as 
described in section Rl06 and section Rl08. Any nullified permit where the suspension 
or abandonment have exceeded one year will require the permittee to pay a new permit 
fee plus plan review fee. 

Any person holding an unexpired and valid permit may apply for an extension of time to 
commence work, return to work or complete work under that permit by submitting a 
written request describing good and satisfactory reason for such extension. This request 
shall be received prior to the date on which the original permit expires or becomes null 
and void. An extended permit is valid for 180 days from the date of the extension, does 
not require compliance with codes adopted since the original permit was issued, and 
does not require payment of new fees. No permit shall be extended more than twice. 

7 



1111 w .. ,~,.~.~IIJI~Ir\1. Nr/f~,ll\1 ~ !Ho&:IM!t~·~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
B of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

When a permit has expired or been nullified and a new addition of the building code has 
been adopted, the original plans shall be reviewed and required to comply with the 
current code. The permittee shall pay a new plan review fee based on the current 
projected valuation plus the applicable fee listed above. 

8. Section Rl06 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

R106.1.4 Proof of water and sewer. The applicant shall provide documentation that 
water and sewer taps have been obtained from the appropriate utility district when the 
property will be served by the district. 

9. Section Rl06.2 is amended by adding the following: 

R 106.2.1 Additional Site Plan Requirements. 
Any site plan for the placement of any portion of a structure within 50ft. of a property 
line and not within a previously surveyed building envelope on a subdivision final plat 
shall be prepared by a licensed surveyor and have the surveyor's signature and 
professional stamp on the drawing. Any structure to be built within a building envelope 
of a lot shown on a recorded subdivision plat, shall include a copy of the building 
envelope as it is shown on the final plat with the proposed structure located within .the 
envelope. 

l 0. Section Rl 07 as written is deleted and replaced with the following: 

R107.1 Temporary housing. The building official may allow a home owner/builder to 
place temporary housing in the form of a self contained mobile home, camper or 
recreational vehicle; or properly placed mobile home connected to an approved 
individual sewage disposal system, during active construction of a permanent home. 

R107.2 Occupancy. Temporary housing shall be; inhabited by the owner/builder to 
which the approval has been given; located at a construction site for which a building 
permit has been issued and is currently unexpired; and, provided with a water supply 
and sanitation system approved by the building official. 

R107.3 Approval validity. The approval is valid while the building permit is valid 
and occupancy will be discontinued upon final inspection or invalidation of the building 
permit. 

II. Section Rl 08.2 is amended to read as follows: 

R108.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, gas, mechanical and 
plumbing systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for the permit shall be paid as 
required, in accordance with the attached Exhibit B, building permit fee schedule. 

8 



1111 Mi'•~~~~~~~~,l~l.l'tllPII~I'i\llllU+t.UrfV.:IW~"IIIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
9 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Coo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

12. Section Rl08.6 is amended by adding a subsection: 

R108.6.1 Penalty fee. Work being done without a permit will be subject to a fee or 
penalty equal to the permit fee. Ibis fee or penalty is in addition to the permit and plan 
check fees. 

13. Section Rl08.5 is amended to read as follow: 

R108.S Refunds. The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy. 
The building official may authorize refunding of all or a portion of the permit fee paid 
when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. The 
building official shall not authorize refunding of any fee paid except on written 
application filed by the original permittee. 

14. Section Rl09.3 is amended to read: 

R109.3 Inspection requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, the 
owner, contractor or subcontmctor to know that the building or structure has a valid 
permit and to notify the building department when work is ready for inspection. Upon 
conviction, a fine will be assessed to the person doing the work, the owner, contmctor or 
subcontractor if work is being done without a permit and the inspection is not requested 
per section Rl09. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, the owner, 
contractor or subcontractor requesting any inspections required by this code to provide 
legal and adequate access and means for inspection of such work. Such request for 
inspection may be in writing or by calling the 24-hour automated telephone answering 
system. 

15. Section Rl09.5 is added to read: 

R109.S Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or 
reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or 
when corrections called for are not made. Reinspection fees may be assessed when the 
inspection record card is not posted or otherwise available on j:he work site, the 
approved plans are not readily available to the inspector, for failing to provide access on 
the date for which the inspection is requested or deviating from the approved plans. In 
instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the 
work will be performed until the reinspection fee has been received by the building 
department. 

16. Section Rill is amended to read as follows: 

Rlll.l Connection of service utilities •. This subsection deleted. 

R111.2 Temporary connection. This subsection deleted. 

9 



1111 Ml'•lllnlP".I'VIBr!f rv l.t"'llt,~lrflfoJ~IW.I'Wt~"A IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 09:28:44 AM Jean Alberlco 
10 af 46 Reo Fee:$0.0~ Doo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

Section Rlll.3 is retained as part of the code. 

17. Section Rl12 is amended to add the following: 

In Sec R112 and where ever in this code there is reference made to Board of 
Appeals, it shall be amended to read Board of Review. 

18. Section R113.1 is amended to read as follows: 

R113.1 Unlawful acts. Any person as defmed herein (Section R202) who erects, 
constructs, reconstructs, remodels, enlarges, alters, repairs, moves, improves, converts, 
demolishes, equips, uses, occupies, or maintains any building or structure, or any part of 
a building or structure, in the unincorporated area of Garfield County or causes the same 
to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provisions of this code, or any provisions 
of part 2, article 28, title 30, C.R.S., 2009, as amended, shall be deemed guilty of a 
misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof, shall be fined not more than $100.00, or by 
imprisonment in the county jail for not more than ten days, or both by such fine and 
imprisbnment. Each and every day during which such illegal erection, construction, 
reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, improvement, 
conversion, demolition, maintenance or use continues shall be deemed a separate 
offense. Nothing herein limits or alters the penalties and other enforcement actions that 
may be authorized by part 2, article 28, title 30, C.R.S., 2009, as amended, In case any 
building or structure is or is proposed to be erected, constructed, reconstructed, 
enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, converted, demolished, maintained or 
used in violation of this code or of any provision of part 2, article 28, title 30, C.R.S., as 
amended, the County Attorney, the Board of County Commissioners of Garfield 
County, or any owner of real estate within the area subject to this code, in addition to 
other remedies provided by law, may institute an appropriate action for injunction, 
mandamus or abatement to prevent, enjoin, abate, or remove such unlawful erection, 
construction, reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, 
improvement, conversion, demolition, maintenance or use. 

19. Section R202 is amended by adding or replacing the following definitions within 
the alphabetical order ofthe existing definitions. 

a. ACCESSORY STRUCTURE. A structure not greater than 3,000 square feet (279 
sq. m.) in floor area and not over two stories in height, the use of which is customarily 
accessory to and incidental to that of the dwelling(s) and which is located on the same 
lot. Accessory buildings other than approved accessory dwelling units are not allowed 
to have a shower or a bath. 

b. AGRICULTURAL BUILDING. A structure designed and constructed to house 
farm implements, hay, grain, poultry, livestock or other horticultural products. This 
structure shall not be a place of employment where agricultural products are processed, 
treated or packaged, nor shall it be a place used by the public. The sole purpose of the 

10 



1111 Ml'.i.lllnll".l'¥1~1r ~ lf.l".~~~lll(~l¥!':~~~~ II II I 
Reception": 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Albarioo 
11 of 48 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doo Fas:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

building must be agricultural. Excluded from the definition of agricultural building are 
structures enclosing indoor riding arenas with an occupant load of 10 or more. 

c. BUILDING. Building shall mean any one-and two-family dwelling or portion 
thereof, including townhouses, that is used, or designed or intended to be used for 
human habitation, for living, sleeping, cooking or eating purposes, or any combination 
thereof, and shall include accessory structures thereto. 
Minimum building dimension is (20) feet wide and twenty (20) feet long. 

d. BEDROOM. A room which is designed as a sleeping room, a loft, a mezzanine or a 
room or area that can be used as a sleeping room and contains a closet. 

e. CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY. A written notification from the building 
official to the property owner that the work covered under the permit is complete and 
the permit is closed. 

f. DWELLING UNIT. A single unit providing complete, independent living facilities 
for one or more persons, including permanent provisions for living, sleeping, eating, 
cooking and sanitation, and having just one kitchen. 

g. FACTORY BUILT BUILDING. A building which is assembled in a facility 
that has been approved by the State of Colorado, built to the building plumbing and 
mechanical codes as adopted by the Colorado Division of Housing, with the work 
performed at the facility inspected by and bearing the Colorado Division of Housing 
identification label. 

h. FIRE DEPARTMENT OFFICIAL. The chief officer of any of the fire protection 
districts within Garfield County, or the chief officer's authorized representative. 

i. HEIGHT, BUILDING. See Garfield County Zoning for building height 
restrictions. 

j. KITCHEN. A room or area that is designated to be used for the cooking and 
preparation offood, which contains one or more standard size kitchen appliances or 
fixtures. 

k. MANUFACTURED HOME. A single family dwelling which is partially or entirely 
assembled in a factory, is not less than twenty feet in width and twenty feet in length, is 
installed on an permanent foundation, has a brick, wood or cosmetically equivalent 
exterior and a pitched roof, is certified pursuant to the ''National Manufactured Housing 
Construction and Safety Standards Act of 1974", 42 U.S.C. 5401 et esq., as amended, 
and bearing the H.U.D. identification label. Installed and set up as required in the set up 
manual supplied with the manufactured home. 

1. PERSON. A natural person or any individual, partnership, corporation, association, 

11 



•111 fr"" l~l".a'¥1M ~rltll' I,IW,I;&~~I'IIr.IJtl'~,~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean Rlberico 
12 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doo F•e:0.00 GRRFIELD COUNTY CO 

company or other public or corporate body, including the federal government, and 
includes any political subdivision, agency, instrumentality, or corporation of the state or 
the United States government. Singular includes plural, male includes female. 

m. RECREATIONAL CABINS. A residential structure with no more than 1200s.f. of 
gross floor area including unfinished basements and being a maximum of 25ft. to the 
peak of the roof from the ground floor and intended to be occupied as a dwelling for no 
more than six (6) months within any calendar year for recreation and/or leisure use; not 
to be used for commercial purposes; that has no direct access from a maintained public 
or private road to the recreational cabin, and the direct access requires at a minimum, a 
private vehicle to have the four-wheel drive engaged for at least one-half mile when the 
recreational cabin is accessible by road. One recreational cabin is allowed on a legally 
created parcel. 

n. USEABLE SPACE UNDER FLOORS. Useable space is that space under the first 
story between the underside of the floor joist or floor truss and the ground below which 
exceeds 46 inches at any point. 

o. WET BAR. An area of a room that is designed to be used for serving of beverages, 
that may only have a single bar sink and no standard size kitchen appliances such as a 
stove, oven, dishwasher or full sized refrigerator. Counter space is limited to 25 square 
ft. 

p. HABIT ABLE SPACE. A space in a building used for living, sleeping, eating or 
cooking. Bathrooms, toilet rooms, closets, halls, storage or utility spaces and similar 
areas are not considered habitable space. Unfinished basements with a ceiling height of 
84 inches or more are considered habitable space. 

20. Section R301 is amended to add as follows: 

Table R301.2(1) 

ROOF SNOW LOAD REPLACES GROUND SNOW LOAD as determined by Garfield 
County snow load based on elevation: 

To 7000ft. 
7001 to 8000ft 
8001 to 9000ft 
9001 to 10,000 

40psf 
50psf 
75psf 
100psf 

Potential unbalanced accumulations of snow at valleys, parapets, roof structures and 
offsets in roofs of uneven configuration shall be considered. Minimum snow loads are 
in pound per square foot of horizontal projected area. All snow load roof designs are to 
be designed and stamped by a Colorado registered professional engineer or architect. 

12 



1111 Ml"o1. lillli'.I'¥1N'I\IM~J.It/4 ~~~~~"lft"ltl'l'lll•i IIIII 
Reception#: 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 ~M Jean Alberico 
13 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doo Fee~0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

WIND SPEED- 90MPH Exposure B or C See Sec. R301.2.1.4. 

SEISMIC DESIGN CATEGORY- B 

WEATHERING PROBABILITY FOR CONCRETE- Severe 

FROST LINE DEPTH- 36 in. to 8000ft. of elevation. 42 in. over 8000ft. 
TERMITE INFESTATION PROBABU:.. TY- None to slight 

DECAY PROBABIL TY- None to slight 

WINTER DESIGN TEMPERATURE- minus 2 to 7000ft.; minus 16 over 
7000ft. of elevation 

ICE SHIELD UNDER-LAYMENT REQUIRED-- Yes 

AIR FREEZING INDEX- 2500deg F-days to 7000ft. elevation; above 7000 
Ft. to be determined by Building Official. · 

MEAN ANNUAL TEMP- Variable 

21. Section R302 is amended to add the following: 

1. A footnote is added to Table R302.6: 1. Gypsum board separation shall be continuous 
around and behind all surface membrane penetrations in separation walls or ceilings. 

2. R302.2 a sentence is added to the Exception to read: This exception is only 
for townhouses with an approved fire sprinkler system meeting the requirements 
ofthis code. 

22. Section R305.1 is amended to read as follows: 

R305.l Minimum height. Habitable rooms, hallways, corridors, bathrooms, 
toilet rooms, laundry rooms and basements, finished or unfinished, shall have a ceiling 
height of not less than 7 feet. The required height shall be measured from the finish 
floor to the lowest projection from the ceiling. 

Exceptions: 

I. Beams and girders spaced not less than 4 feet on center may project not 
more than 6 inches below the required ceiling height. 

2. Not more than 50 percent of the required floor area of a room or space is 
permitted to have a sloped ceiling less than 7 feet in height with no portion of the 

13 



•m ftl\".1. ~~P"~IIIl:llj!M'~\I'."~'I'IIrW~o+~~:llll':~~~llllll 
Reception~: 821496 
m7118/2012 09:29:44 AM Jean Alberico 
14 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.00 GRRFIELD COUNTY CO 

required floor area less than 5 teet in height. 

3. Bathrooms shall have a minimum ceiling height of 6 feet 8 inches over the fixtures 
and at the front clearance area for fixtures as shown in Figure R307.l. A shower or 
tub equipped with a showerhead shall have a minimum ceiling height of 6 feet 8 
inches above a minimum area 30 inches by 30 inches at the showerhead. 

23. Section R306 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

R306.5 Sanitation at construction sites. Toilet facilities shall be provided for 
construction workers and such facilities shall be conveniently located and maintained in 
a sanitary condition. The facilities shall be available from the time the first work is 
started until the certificate of occupancy is issued. 

24. Section R3l3 is deleted. 

Automatic fire sprinkler systems are an option unless required by the subdivision or 
PUD zoning. If installed, the systems must be designed and installed in accordance with 
SectionP2904orNFPA l3D. 

25. Section R403.1 is amended to read as follows: 

R403.1 General. All exterior walls shall be supported on continuous solid or fully 
grouted masonry or concrete footings, wood foundations in accordance with AF &P A 
PWF, or other approved structural systems which shall be of sufficient design to 
accommodate all loads according to Section R30l and to transmit the resulting loads to 
the soil within the limitations as determined from the character of the soil. Footings 
shall be supported on undisturbed natural soils or engineered fill. Except where erected 
on solid rock or otherwise protected from frost, foundation walls, piers and other 
permanent supports of buildings and structures larger than 120 square feet in area or 10 
feet in height shall extend to at least 36 inches below finished grade, and spread footings 
of8 inches Tthick by 16 inches Wwide minimum size shall be provided to properly 
distribute the load within the allowable load-bearing value of the soil. Alternatively, 
such structures shall be supported on piles where solid earth or rock is not available. 
Garfield County will not inspect the drilling, reinforcement and placement of caissons. 
A qualified engineer must perform this inspection. Findings must be detailed in a typed, 
stamped report to the building department. Footings shall not bear on frozen soils. 
Concrete footings shall include a minimum of two #4 reinforcement bars to be tied 
continuously and spaced a minimum of three inches from the ground and equally within 
the footing. Dowels shall be 1- #44ft. long with an Sin. hook placed 36in. on center. 
Footings shall be so designed that the allowable bearing capacity of the soil is not 
exceeded, and that differential settlement is minimized. The minimum width of 
footings shall be 16 inches W. 

Exception: I. Unless designed and sealed by an engineer or architect. 

14 



1111 M\".1. llftP"~IIIfliJlllli.IM llli lll'\':~(.lofi'l¥lt'llf•~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 R~ Jean Alberico 
15 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Coo Fee:0.00 GRRFIELD COUNTY CO 

2. Monolithic, thickened slabs with detached garages. 
3. Wood foundations are limited to have no more than two floors and 

a roof; and interior basement and foundation walls at intervals not 
exceeding 50 ft. 

26. Section R403.1.1 is amended to read as follows: 

R403.1.1 Minimum size. Spread footings shall be at least 8 inches in thickness T. 
Footing projections, P, shall be at least 2 inches. Footings for wood foundations shall be 
in accordance with the details set forth in Section R403.2, and Figures R403.1(2) and 
R403.1(3). 

27. Section R403.1.3.1 is amended to read as follows: 

R403.1.3.1 Foundations with stemwaUs. Foundations with stemwalls shall be 
provided with a minimum of2- #4 top and bottom of wall and 1-#4 18in. O.C. 
vertical and horizontal for wall up to 8 ft. in height. Wails over 8 ft. shall be a 
designed and sealed by a Colorado registered engineer or architect. 

28. Section R403.3 is amended to read as follows: 

R403.3 Frost protected shaDow foundations. For buildings where the monthly mean 
temperature of the building is maintained at a minimum of 64 degree F, footings are not 
required to extend below the frost line when protected from frost by insulation in 
accordance with Figure R403.3(1) and Table R403.3. Foundations protected from frost 
in accordance with Figure R403.3(1) and Table R403.3 shall not be used for unheated 
spaces such as porches, utility rooms, garages and carports, and shall not be attached to 
basements or crawl spaces that are not maintained at a minimum mean temperature of 
64 degree F. Minimum Air Freeze index for Garfield County for frost protected shallow 
foundation design is 2,500 F-days. Materials used below grade for the purpose of 
insulating footings against frost shall be labeled as complying with ASTM C578. 

29. Section R602.1.3 is amended to add the following Exceptions: 

Exceptions: 

1. In single family dwellings of log construction, wall logs need not be graded. 
2. In single family dwellings oflog construction, all structural logs shall be designed 

by a licensed Colorado architect or engineer and inspected by that architect or 
engineer after the completion of the framing with the architect or engineer certifYing 
to the building department that the logs are of the size, quality and species of the 
design and that they were installed to that design. Wall logs need not be part of the 
structural design. 

30. Section R802.2 is amended to add a sentence to the existing text. 

15 



1111 Wo~.t~I'~II'I'IIN".MI~i~llf'I:~IM'."Hr;~,~lllll 
Reception#: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
16 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

The use ofload duration factors for snow load shall be prohibited. 

31. Section R802.1 0.2 is amended add a sentence to the existing text: 

The use ofload duration factors for snow load shall be prohibited. 

32. Section R903 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

R903.6 Snow-shed barriers. Roofs shall be designed to prevent accumulations of 
snow from shedding above or in front of gas utility or electric utility meters and egress 
doors. 

33. Section R905.4 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

R905.4. 7 Mechanical barriers. Mechanical barriers installed to prevent snow 
shedding from the roof shall be secured to roof framing members or to solid blocking 
secured to framing members in accordance with the manufacturer's installation 
instructions. Individual devices installed in a group of devices to create a barrier to 
prevent snow shedding shall be installed in at least two rows with the first row no more 
than 24 inches from the edge of the roof or eave. The rows shall be parallel with the 
exterior wall line and the devices in each row shall be staggered for a spacing of no 
more than 24 inches on center measured parallel with the exterior wall line. Continuous 
snow barriers shall be secured to roof framing at no more than 48 inches on center. 
Continuous barriers shall be installed parallel with the exterior wall line and .no more 
than 24 inches from the edge of the roof or eave. 

34. Section R905.10 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

R905.10.6 Mechanical barriers. Mechanical barriers installed to prevent snow 
shedding from the roof shall be secured to roof framing members or to solid blocking 
secured to framing members in accordance with the manufacturer's installation 
instructions. Individual devices installed in a group of devices to create a barrier to 
prevent snow shedding shall be installed in at least two rows with the frrst row no more 
than 24 inches from the edge of the roof or eave. The rows shall be parallel with the 
exterior wall line and the devices in each row shall be staggered for a spacing of no 
more than 24 inches on center measured parallel with the exterior wall line. 
Continuous snow barriers shall be secured to roof framing at no more than 48 inches on 
center. Continuous barriers shall be installed parallel with the exterior wall line and no 
more than 24 inches from the edge of the roof or eave. 

35. Section R907.1 is amended to read as follows: 

R907.1 General. Materials and methods of application used for recovering or 
Replacing an existing roof covering shall comply with the requirements of 

16 



1111 Ml"o1o lllnlll.a'1111lli' llll:lt~ II~ I!II:W.INI:H~'~ IIIII 
Reception#: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Rlberioo 
17 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GRRFIELD COUNTY CO 

Chapter 9. A separate permit is required for re-roofing. 

36. Section R1004 is amended to delete Sec. R1004.4. 

37. Section R1005 is amended by adding new subsection to read as follows: 

R1005. 7 Factory-built chimneys shall be effectively fire blocked within the chase 
enclosure at each floor-ceiling level and at the roof. The vertical distance between 
adjacent fire blocking shall not exceed 10 feet. 

38. Section Ml308 is amended to add the following: 

M1308.3 LPG (liquid petroleum gas) appliances. LPG appliances shall not be 
installed in a pit, basement or similar location where heavier than air gases collect 
unless such location is provided with an approved means for removal of unburned gas. 
The policy in Garfield County to approve such a means is as follows: 

1. An untrapped drain with a minimum diameter of 4 inches located in the lowest area 
where heavier than air vapors may collect is to run with a continuous slope to an 
exterior area, which is not within a depression or recessed below the adjacent 
terrain. 

2. The area of termination is to be determined by the building inspector as likely to 
remain free of standing water, ice and other debris that may prevent the flow and 
dissipation of unburned gas. 

3. The upper inlet and the termination of the drain are to be provided with protection 
from the entry of debris or animals, which may cause blockage of the drain. 

39. Section M1401 is amended to add the following subsection: 

Ml401.6 LPG Fuel. See Sec. Ml308.3 on using LPG appliances in a pit or basement. 

40. Section M2001 is amended to add the following subsection: 

M2001.5 LPG Fuel. See sec. M1308.3 On using LPG appliances in a pit or basement. 

41. Section G2404 is amended to add the following subsection: 

G2404.11 LPG Fuel. See Sec. M1308.3 on using LPG appliances in a pit or basement. 

42. Section G2406.2 is amended to read as follows: 

1. G2406.2 Prohibited locations. Appliances shall not be located in sleeping 
rooms, bathrooms, toilet rooms, storage closets or surgical rooms, or in a space that 
opens only into such rooms or spaces, except where the installation complies with one 
of the following: 

17 



Ill/ Wil'.~o l~Cn!l"ll&'lo.NUN "Y.~I-IIIf.l«<:l'm'~,~ IIIII 
Reeeption#: 821496 
07/18/2012 09:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
18 cf 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doo Fae:0.0m GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

I. The appliance is a illrect-vent appliance installed in accordance with the 
conditions of the listing and the manufacturer's instructions. 

2. Vented room heaters, wall furnaces, vented decorative appliances, 
vented gas fireplaces, vented gas fireplace heaters, and decorative 
appliances for installation in vented solid fue!-burningfireplaces are 
installed in rooms that meet the required volume criteria of Section 
02407.5. 

3. The appliance is installed in a room or space that opens only into a 
bedroom or bathroom, and such room or space is used for no other 
purpose and is provided with a solid weather-stripped door equipped 
with an approved self-closing device. All combustion air shall be taken 
directly from the outdoors in accordance with Section 02407.6 

43. Section 02417.4.1 is amended to read as follows: 

G2417.4.1 Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be not less than one 
and one-half times the proposed maximum working pressure, but not less than 
10 psig, irrespective of design pressure .. Where the test pressure exceeds 125 
psig, the test pressure shall not exceed a value that produces a hoop stress in the 
piping greater than 50 percent of the specified minimum yield strength of the 
pipe. 

44. Section 02433 Log Lighters is amended to add the following: 

G2433.1 General. Log lighters are prohibited. 

45. Section G244S Unvented Room Heaters is hereby deleted in its entirety. Unvented 
heaters are not allowed. 

46. Section P260 1.1 is amended to read as follows: 

P2601.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter shall establish the general administrative 
requirements applicable to plumbing systems and inspection requirements of this code. 
The intent of this code is to meet or exceed the requirements of the State of Colorado 
Plumbing Code. When technical requirements, specifications or standards in the 
Colorado Plumbing Code conflict with this code, the more restrictive shall apply. 

47. Section P2603.6.1 is completed by adding 12 in the first[) and 18 in the second 
set of[]. 

48. The entire Part VIII Electrical is deleted. All electrical work shall be done in 
accordance with the State of Colorado Electrical Inspector. 

18 



1111 M1'.1.llfi\P"~1~~~~ IM~ 11\V.trw,ln:~~"' IIIII 
Reception#: 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Albarieo 
19 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

49. Appendix E Manufactured Housing Used as Dwellings is adopted. 

50. Appendix G Swimming Pools, Spas and Hot Tubs is adopted. 

51. Appendix H Patio Covers is adopted. 

52. Appendix J Existing Buildings and Structures is adopted. 

53. Appendix M Home Day Care-R-3 Occupancy is adopted. When there is a conflict 
with State of Colorado regulations, State regulations rule. 

III. 20091NTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE (I.B.C.) 

A. Additions and Modifications: The Sections of the LB. C. are adopted subject to the 
following additions or modifications: 

1. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: 

101.1 Title. This code shall be known as the Commercial Building Code of Garfield 
County, Colorado. This code shall apply to all of the unincorporated area of Garfield 
County, Colorado. 

2. Section 104.1 is amended to read as follows: 

104.1 General The building official or any authorized representative, is hereby · 
authorized and directed to enforce all of the provisions of this code; however, a 
guarantee that all buildings and structures have been constructed in accordance with all 
of the provisions of this code is neither intended nor implied. The building official shall 
have the authority to render interpretations of this code and to adopt policies and 
procedures in order to clarifY the application of its provisions. Such interpretations, 
policies and procedures shall be in conformance with the intent and purpose of this 
code. Such policies and procedures shall not have the effect of waiving requirements 
specifically provided for in this code. 

3. Section 104.8 is amended to read as follows: 

104.8 Liability. The adoption of this code, and any previous codes adopted by Garfield 
County, shall not be deemed to give rise to a duty of care on the part of any public 
entity, public employee or agent, nor shall this code or any previous codes be deemed to 
create any civil remedy against a public entity, public employee or agent. The building 
official, member of the board of appeals or employee charged with the enforcement of 
this code, while acting for the jurisdiction in good faith and without malice in the 
discharge of the duties required by this code or other law or ordinance, shall not thereby 
be rendered liable personally and is hereby relieved from personal liability for any 

19 



1111 M"".io lif+IP"ol'¥1~r ... IW'.Ia"',lfj~ l·[~!lflj;M'III'\\ IIIII 
Receptionn: 821496 
07/19/2012 09:29:44 AM Jean Alberico 
20 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIE~D COUNTY CO 

damage accruing to persons or property as a result of any act or by reason of an act or 
omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit instituted against an officer or 
employee because of an act performed by that officer or employee in the lawful 
discharge of duties and under the provisions of this code shall be defended by legal 
representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings. The 
building official or any subordinate, acting in good faith, shall not be liable for cost in 
any action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of this 
code. 

4. Section 105.2 is amended to read as follows: 

105.2 Work exempt from permit Exemptions from permit requirements of this code 
shall not be deemed to grant authorization for any work to be done in any manner in 
violation of the provisions of this code or any other laws or ordinances of this 
jurisdiction. Permits shall not be required for the following: 

Building: 

a. One story detached accessory structures used as tool and storage sheds, and similar 
uses, provided the floor area does not exceed 120 square feet. 

b. Fences not over 6 feet high used for non-agricultural uses and any fence built for 
agricultural purposes that is a post and wire construction. 

c. Oil derricks. 
d. Retaining walls which are not over 4 feet height measured from the bottom of the 

footing to the top of the wall, unless supporting a surcharge or impounding Class I, 
II or III-A liquids. 

e. Water tanks supported directly upon grade if the capacity does not exceed 5,000 
gallons and the ratio of height to diameter or width does not exceed 2 to 1. 

f. Sidewalks and driveways not more than 30 inches above adjacent grade 
and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an 
accessible route. 

g. Painting, papering, tiling, carpeting, cabinets, counter tops and similar finish 
work. 

h. Temporary motion picture, television and theater stage sets and scenery. 
1. Prefabricated swimming pool accessory to a Group R-3 occupancy, as applicable in 

Section 101.2, which are less than 24 inches deep, do not exceed 5,000 gallons and 
are installed entirely above ground. 

J. Shade cloth structures constructed for nursery or agricultural purposes and not 
including service systems. 

k. Swings and other playground equipment accessory to detached one-and two
family dwellings. 

I. Windows awnings supported by an exterior wall which do not project more than 54 
inches from the exterior wall and do not require additional support of Group R-3, as 
applicable in Section 101.2 and Group U occupancies. 

20 



1111 fr"' llln!P"ill~~j,!HI,IV,IM'LI-1!1:~~1«~~,~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean Alberico 
21 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 ~RFIELD COUNTY CO 

m. Non-fixed and movable cases, counters, and partitions not over 5 feet 9 
inches in height. 

n. Agricultural buildings as defmed in this Resolution. 
o. Housing with 8 or less occupants sleeping in the unit at any one work shift 

on a well pad approved by the Colorado Oil and Gas Conservation 
Commission (COGCC) as it relates to oil and gas well drilling. 

p. Covered porches, roof structures and patio covers less than 1Oft. in depth and/or less 
than 200 square feet in area and the walking surface is less than 30 inches to grade. 

Electrical: 
All electrical permits, inspections, and requirements are as per State of Colorado 
requirements. 

Gas, Mechanical, and Plumbing: 

All are covered under the building permit. Separate permits are not issued. 

5. Section 105.5 is amended to read as follows: 

105.5 Expiration. Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions of 
this code shall expire by limitation and become null and void if the building or work 
authorized by such permit is not commenced within 180 days from the date of such 
permit, or if the building or work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned 
at any time after the work is commenced for a period of 180 days. Permits must pass a 
required inspection during every 180 day period after each inspection in order not to be 
considered suspended or abandoned. On expired permits, before such work can be 
recommenced, a re-issued or new permit shall be obtained. The fee for a re-issued or 
new permit shall be one-half the permit fee of the original permit, provided no changes 
have been made in the original plans and specifications for such work, and further 
provided that such suspension or abandonment has not exceeded one year. Changes in 
plans and specifications shall require an additional permit fee and plan review fee as 
described in section I 09. Any nullified permit where the suspension or abandonment 
have exceeded one year will require the permittee to pay a new permit fee plus plan 
review fee. 

Any person holding an unexpired and valid permit may apply for an extension of time to 
commence work, return to work or complete work under that permit by submitting a 
written request describing good and satisfactory reason for such extension. This request 
shall be received prior to the date on which the original permit expires or becomes null 
and void. An extended permit is valid for 180 days from the date of the extension, does 
not require compliance with codes adopted since the original permit was issued, and 
does not require payment of new fees. No permit shall be extended more than twice. 

When a permit has expired or been nullified and a new addition of the building code has 

21 



IIIII!I".!.I~P".i41ri.lt.Wr11:~~111'~.1t't:W~"";~.~ IIIII 
Reception#: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
22 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

been adopted, the original plans shall be reviewed and required to comply with the 
current code. The permittee shall pay a new plan review fee based on the current 
projected valuation plus the applicable fee listed above 

6. Section l 07 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

107.1.1 Proof of water and sewer. The applicant shall provide documentation that 
water and sewer taps have been obtained from the appropriate utility district when the 
property will be served by the district. 

7. Sedion 107.2.5 is amended by adding the following to the existing text: 

Any site plan for the placement of any portion of a structure within 50 feet of a property 
line and not within a previously surveyed building envelope on a subdivision final plat 
shall be prepared by a licensed surveyor and have the surveyor's signature and 
professional stamp on the drawing. Any structure to be built within a building envelope 
of a lot shown on a recorded subdivision plat, shall include a copy of the building 
envelope as it is shown on the final plat with the proposed structure located within the 
envelope. 

8. Section 109.2 is amended to read as follows: 

109.2 Schedule of permit fees. On buildings, structures, gas, mechanical and plumbing 
systems or alterations requiring a permit, a fee for permit shall be paid as required, in 
accordance-with the attached Exhibit B, building permit fee schedule. 

9. Sedion 109.3 is deleted. 

10. Section 109.4 is amended to read: 

109.4 Work commencing before permit issuance penalty. Working without a permit 
will result in a penalty equal to the permit fee. This penalty fee is in addition to the 
permit and plan review fee. 

II. Section I 09.6 is amended to read: 

109.6 Refunds. The building official is authorized to establish a refund policy. 
The building official may authorize refunding of all or a portion of the permit fee paid 
when no work has been done under a permit issued in accordance with this code. The 
building official shall not authorize refunding of any fee paid except on written 
application filed by the original permittee. 

12. Section 110 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

110.1.1 Sanitation at Construction Sites. Toilet facilities shall be provided for 

22 



•111 M"".l. l..,~~~~r.li\1!111.~ I¥.Y,II'KIItl'lnm"IIW,'~'~ IIIII 
ReQeption~: 821496 
07/18/2012 09:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
23 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doe Fee:0.00 G~RFIELD COUNTY CO 

construction workers and such facilities shall be conveniently located and maintained in 
a sanitary condition. The facilities shall be available from the time the first work is 
started until the certificate of occupancy is issued. 

13. Section 110.3.5 is amended to read as follows: 

110.3.5 Lath and gypsum board inspection. Lath and gypsum board inspections shall 
be made after lathing and gypsum board, interior and exterior, is in place, but before any 
plastering is applied or before gypsum board joints and fasteners are taped and finished. 

14. Section 11 0.5 is amended to read as follows: 

110.5 Inspection requests. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, the owner, 
contractor or subcontractor to know that the building or structure has a valid permit and 
to notify the building department when work is ready for inspection. Upon conviction, a 
fine will be assessed to the person doing the work, the owner, contractor or 
subcontractor if work is being done without a permit and the inspection is not requested 
per Section 110. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, the owner, contractor 
or subcontractor requesting any inspections required by this code to provide legal and 
adequate access and means for inspection of such work. Such request for inspection 
may be in writing or by calling the 24 hour automated telephone answering system. 

15. Section 110.5 is further amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

110.5.1 Reinspections. A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or 
reinspection when such portion of work for which inspection is called is not complete or 
when corrections called for are not made. Reinspection fees may be assessed when the 
inspection record card is not posted or otherwise available on the work site, the 
approved plans are not readily available to the inspector, for failing to provide access on 
the date for which the inspection is requested or deviating from the approved plans. In 
instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additional inspection of the 
work will be performed until the reinspection fee has been received by the building 
department. 

16. Section 113 is amended to add the following: 

In Sec 113 and where ever in this code there is a reference made to Board of 
Appeals, it shall be amended to read Board of Review. 

17. Section 114.1 is amended as follows: 

114 . 1 Unl.awful. acts. Any person as defined herein (Section 202) who erects, 
constructs, reconstructs, remodels, enlarges, alters, repairs, moves, improves, converts, 
demolishes, equips, uses, occupies, or maintains any building or structure, or any part of 
a building or structure, in the unincorporated area of Garfield County or causes the same 

23 



II II Ml".i.lllnli",IN:II UAI' IU'.I~II.I"'II\l"lt'TCIIII't'~·~ IIIII 
Reception~; 821496 
07/18/2012 08:29:44 AM Jean Alberico 
24 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:G.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provisions of this code, or any provisions 
of part 2, article 28, title 30, C.R.S., 2009, as amended, shall be deemed guilty of a 
misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof, shall be fmed not more than $100.00, or by 
imprisonment in the county jail for not more than ten days, or both by such fine and 
imprisonment. Each and every day during which such illegal erection, construction, 
reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, improvement, 
conversion, demolition, maintenance or use continues shall be deemed a separate 
offense. Nothing herein limits or alters the penalties and other enforcement actions that 
may be authorized by part 2, article 28, title 30, C.R.S., 2009, as amended, In case any 
building or structure is or is proposed to be erected, constructed, reconstructed, 
enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, converted, demolished, maintained or 
used in violation of this code or of any provision of part 2, article 28, title 30, C.R.S., as 
amended, the County Attorney, the Board of County Commissioners of Garfield 
County, or any owner of real estate within the area subject to this code, in addition to 
other remedies provided by law, may institute an appropriate action for injunction, 
mandamus or abatement to prevent, enjoin, abate, or remove such unlawful erection, 
construction, reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, 
improvement, conversion, demolition, maintenance or use. 

18. Section 202 is amended by adding or replacing the following definitions within the 
alphabetical order of the existing definitions. 

AGRICULTURAL BUILDING. A structure designed and constructed to house 
farm implements, hay, grain, poultry, livestock or other horticultural products. This 
structure shall not be a place of human habitation or a place of employment where 
agricultural products are processed, treated or packaged, nor shall it be a place used by 
the public. Excluded from the definition of agricultural building are structures enclosing 
indoor riding arenas with an occupant load of 10 or more. 

BEDROOM. A room which is designed as a sleeping room, a loft, a mezzanine 
in Group R occupancies or a room or area that can be used as a sleeping room and 
contains a closet. 

CERTIFICATE OF OCCUPANCY. A written notification from the building 
official to the property owner that the work covered under the permit is complete and 
the permit is closed. 

DWELLING UNIT. A single unit providing complete, independent living facilities for 
one or more persons, including permanent provisions for living, sleeping, eating, 
cooking and sanitation, and having just one kitchen. 

FACTORY BUILT BUILDING. A building which is assembled in a facility 
that has been approved by the State of Colorado, built to the building, plumbing 
and mechanical codes as adopted by the Colorado Division of Housing, with the 
work performed at the facility inspected by and bearing the Colorado Division of 

24 



•111 Ml""" lif1111",.rMIIIIf'f,l~ II\'~ IPI':'rrl(,I.WIWI','~"I IIIII 
Receptlan~: 821496 
07/1a/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Rlberioo 
25 of 46 Reo Faa:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

Housing identification label. 

KITCHEN, A room or area that is designated to be used for the preparation of food 
which contains one or more standard size kitchen appliances or fixtures. 

PERSON. A natural person or any individual, partnership, corporation, association, 
company or other public or corporate body, including the federal government, and 
includes any political subdivision, agency, instrumentality, or corporation of the state or 
the United States government. Singular includes plural, male includes female. 

USEABLE SPACE UNDER FLOORS. Useable space is that space under the first 
story between the underside of the floor joist or floor truss and the ground below which 
exceeds 46 inches at any point. 

19. Add Free standing signs over 10 fl of height to the descriptions Under Section 312 
Utility and Miscellaneous Group U. 

20. Section 504 is amended to add Section 504.l.l 

504.1.1 Allowable building height is specified in Garfield County Zoning. 

21. Section 901.5 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

901.5.1 Fire protection systems inspector required. All fire protection systems 
required by this code shall be inspected and approved by a inspector. The inspector 
shall be an authorized representative oftheflre department official or another qualified 
individual with prior approval of the building official. 

22. Section 902.1 is amended by adding the following definition within the alphabetical 
order of the existing definitions. 

FIRE DEPARTMENT OFFICIAL. The fire department official or the state of 
Colorado Division of Fire Safety or their authorized representative shall be an approved 
agency for inspection of fire protection systems required by this code. 

23. Section 903.2.8 is amended by adding the following exceptions: 

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic spriokler system installed in accordance with 
Section 903.3 shall be provided throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area. 

Exception: 1. Group R-3 and boarding houses occupancies. 
2. Group R-2 with occupancy of 5 or less (maximum floor area of 

1000 square ft. Table 1004.1.1 ). 

24. Section 1503 is amended by adding two new subsections to read as follows: 

25 



1111 M\".1. llfnlll'ol'¥iiV~ ~triM WI'~ lllrr-M~I.,r,IITI:~·V. IIIII 
Reception«: 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean ~lberico 
26 of 46 Rec Fae:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.00 G~RFIELD COUNTY CO 

1503.7 Snow-shed barriers. Roofs shall be designed to prevent accumulations of snow 
from shedding above or in front of gas utility or electric utility meters and egress doors. 

1503.7.1 Mechanical barriers for metal roof shingles and metal roof panels. 
Mechanical barriers installed to prevent snow shedding from the roof shall be secured to 
roof framing members or to solid blocking secured to framing members in accordance 

with the manufacturer's installation instructions. Individual devices installed in a 
group of devices to create a barrier to prevent snow shedding shall be installed in at 
least two rows with the first row no more than 24 inches from the edge of the roof or 
eave. The rows shall be parallel with the exterior wall line and the devices in each row 
shall be staggered for a spacing of no more than 24 inches on center measured parallel 
with the exterior wall line Continuous snow barriers shall be secured to roof framing at 
no more than 48 inches on center. Continuous barriers shall be installed parallel with 
the exterior wall line and no more than 24 inches from the edge of the roof or eave. 

25. Section 1608.2 is amended to read as follows: 

1608.2 Roof snow load. As determined by Garfield County snow load based on 
elevations. Snow loads are as follows: 

TO 7000FT. 40PSF 
7001 TO 8000FT. SOPSF 
8001 TO 9000FT. 75PSF 
9001 TO lO,OOOFT. lOOPSF 

Potential unbalanced accumulations of snow at valleys, parapets, roof structures and 
offsets in roofs of uneven configuration shall be considered. Minimum snow loads are 
in pounds per square foot of horizontal projected area. All snow load designs are to be 
designed and sealed by a Colorado registered professional engineer or architect. 

26. Section l 807.1 amended to read as follows: 

1807.1 GeneraL Foundations shall be designed and constructed in accordance with 
Sections 1807.1.1 through 1807.1.6. All foundations shall be designed and sealed by a 
Colorado licensed engineer or architect except for foundations supporting a Group S-1 
or U occupancy not over 600 square foot of maximum floor area 

27. Section 1807.2 is amended to read as follows: 

1807.2 Retaining walls. Retaining walls shall be designed in accordance with Sections 
1807.2.1 through 1807.2.3 and be designed by a Colorado licensed engineer or architect. 

28. Section 1807.3 is amended to read as follows: 

26 



.lllllf.lrl'lll'II'.HINrl' ~IM lllfi\\.I'Polr,.,ll'lliiiJI'illl''& •1111 
Reception#: 821496 
07/19/2012 09:28:44 AM Jean Alberioo 
27 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

1807.3 Embedded post and poles. Designs to resist both axial and lateral loads 
employing post or poles as colwnns embedded in earth or in concrete footings in earth 
shall be in accordance with Sections 1807.3.1 through 1807.3.3 and designed and sealed 
by a Colorado licensed engineer or architect. 

29. Section 1808.1 is amended as follows 

1808.1 General. Foundations shall be designed and constructed in accordance with 
Sections 1808.2 through 1808.9. Shallow foundations shall also satisfy the 
requirements of Section 1809. Deep foundations shall also satisfy the requirements of 
Section 1810. All foundations shall be designed and sealed by a Colorado licensed 
engineer or architect except for foundations supporting a Group S-I or U occupancy not 
over 600 square foot of footprint. 

30. Section 1810.1 is amended to read as follows: 

1810.1 General. Deep foundations shall be analyzed, designed, detailed and installed 
in accordance with Sections 1810.1 through 1810.4 and designed by a Colorado licensed 
architect or engineer. Garfield County will not inspect the drilling, reinforcement and 
placement of piers, piles or shafts. The engineer of record shall perform all inspections 
of the installation and provide the County with a sealed letter approving the work prior 
to the fmal inspection of the building or structure. 

31. Section.2301.2 is amended to add item 5. 

5. The use ofload duration factors for snow load shall not be permitted in any of these 
design methods. Load Duration equals 1.0. 

32. 2303.1.10 is amended to add the following exceptions: 

Exceptions: 

1. In single family dwellings of log construction, wall logs need not be graded. 

2. In log construction, all structural log designs and connections shall be designed by a 
licensed Colorado architect or engineer and inspected by that architect or engineer after 
the completion of the framing with the architect or engineer certifying to the building 
department that the logs are of the size, quality and species of the design and that they 
were installed to that design. Wall logs need not be part of the structural design. 

33. Section 2901.1 is amended to read as follows: 

2901.1 Scope. The provisions of this chapter and the International Plumbing Code 
shall govern the erection, installation, alteration, repairs, relocation, replacement, 
addition to, use or maintenance of plwnbing equipment and systems. Plumbing systems 

27 



•1/llll'olol'llnr."~l 1111'/'ol"'ll'oiii'W 11'11 llllllolo'Wiol!l''lol!l""' •1 II I 
Reception#: 821496 
07/18/2012 09:28:44 ~M Jean Alberico 
28 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.0~ GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

and equipment shall be constructed, installed and maintained in accordance with the 
Interootional Plumbing Code. Private sewage disposal systems shall conform to the 
Guidelines on Individual Sewage Disposal Systems as published by the Colorado 
Department of Public Health and Environment, Water Quality Control Division. 

34. Section 3001.1 is amended to read as follows: 

3001.1 Scope. This chapter governs the design, construction, installation, alteration, 
maintenance and repair of new and existing installations of elevators, dumbwaiters, 
escalators, and moving walks, requiring permits therefore and providing procedures for 
the inspection and maintenance of such conveyances. 

35. Chapter 30, concerning elevators, moving walks, escalators or dumbwaiters, is amended 
by adding three new sections and associated subsections to read as follows: 

SECTION 3009 

PERMITS AND CERTIFICATES OF INSPECTION 

3009.1 Permits required. It shall be unlawful to install any new elevator, moving 
walk, escalator or dumbwaiter, or to make major alterations to any existing elevator, 
dumbwaiter, escalator or moving walk, as defmed in part xii of ASME A 17.1, without 
first having obtained a permit for such installation. Permits shall not be required for 
maintenance or minor alterations. 

3009.2 Certificates ofinspection required. It shall be unlawful to operate any 
elevator, dumbwaiter, escalator or moving walk without a current certificate of 
inspection issued by the approved inspection agency. Such certificate shall be issued 
upon payment of prescribed fees and the presentation of a valid inspection report 
indicating that the conveyance is safe and that the inspections and tests have been 
performed in accordance with part XII of the ASME Al7 .1. Certificates shall not be 
issued when the conveyance is posted as unsafe pursuant to section 3010. 

3009.3 Application for permit. Application for a permit to install shall be made on 
forms provided by the inspection agency, and the permit shall be issued to an owner 
upon payment of the permit fees specified. 

3009.4 Application for certificate of inspection. Application for a certificate of 
inspection shall be made by the owner of an elevator, dumbwaiter, escalator or moving 
walk. Applications shall be accompanied by an inspection report as described in section 
3009. Fees for certificates of inspection shall be as specified by the inspection agency. 

3009.5 Fees. A fee for each permit and certificate of inspection shall be paid to the 
inspection agency. 

28 



1111 M'l'.~o l'lnii'.I'YiiV'IIII~f 1"-~ I,IJ~ lnll:ltlrl~""'~"lll II I 
Reception#: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
29 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

SECTION 3010 
DESIGN 

3010.1 Detailed requirements. For detailed design, construction and installation 
requirements, see Chapter 16 and the appropriate requirements of ASME 
A17.1. 

SECTION 3010 
REQUIREMENTS FOR OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE 

3010.2 General. The owner shall be responsible for the safe operation and maintenance 
of each elevator, dumbwaiter, escalator and moving walk installation and shall cause 
periodic inspections to be made on such conveyances as required in this section. 

3010.3 Periodic inspections and tests. Routine and periodic inspections and tests shall 
be made as required by Part X of ASME Al7.l. 

3010.4 Alterations, repairs and maintenance. Alterations, repairs and maintenance 
shall be made as required by Part Xll of ASME Al7.1. 

3010.5 Inspection costs. All costs of such inspections and tests shall be paid by the 
owner. 

SECTION 3011 
UNSAFE CONDITIONS 

3011.1 Unsafe conditions. When an inspection reveals an unsafe condition of an 
elevator, moving walk, escalator or dumbwaiter, the inspector shall immediately file 
with the owner and the building official a full and true report of such inspection and 
such unsafe condition. If the building official finds that the unsafe condition endangers 
human life, the building official shall cause to be placed on such elevator, escalator or 
moving walk, in a conspicuous place, a notice stating that such conveyance is unsafe. 
The owner shall see to it that such notice of unsafe condition is legibly maintained 
where placed by the building official. The building official shall also issue an order in 
writing to the owner requiring the repairs or alterations to be made to such conveyance 
that are necessary to render it safe and may order the operation thereof discontinued 
until the repairs or alterations are made or the unsafe conditions are removed. A posted 
notice of unsafe conditions shall be removed only by the building official when satisfied 
that the unsafe conditions have been corrected. 

36. Section 3311.2 is amended to read as follows: 

3311.2 Buildings being demolished. Where a building is being demolished and a 

29 



1111 M"' • lllnl r.n1~~Ut~llfl& l¥;,111~d'l'li 111 o; ~ 11"1\ Ill'"' •1111 
ReceptJon#: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean Alberico 
30 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Oco Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

standpipe is existing within such a building, such standpipe shall be maintained in an 
operable condition so as to be available for use by the Fire Department Official. Such 
standpipe shall be demolished with the building but shall not be demolished more than 
one floor below the floor being demolished or as approved by the Fire Department 
Official. 

37. Section 3311.4 is amended to read as follows: 

3311.4 Water supply. Water supply for fire protection, either temporary or permanent 
shall be made available as soon as combustible material accumulates or as approved by 
the Fire Department Official. 

38. Section 3401.3 is amended to read as follows: 

3401.3 Compliance with other codes. Alterations, repairs, additions and changes of 
occupancy to existing structures shall comply with the provisions for alterations, repairs, 
additions and changes of occupancy in the International Fire-Code, Interootional Fuel 
Gas Code, International Plumbing Code, Guidelines On Individual Sewage Disposal 
Systems as published by the Colorado Department of Public Health and Environment, 
Water Quality Control Division, International Mechanical Code, and International 
Residential Code. 

39. Section 3412.2 is amended to read as follows: 

3412.2 Applicability. Structures existing prior to January 1, 1978 in which there is 
work involving additions, alterations or changes of occupancy shall be made to conform 
to the requirements ofthis section or the provisions of Sections 3403 through 3409. The 
provisions in Sections 3412.2.1 through 3412.2.5 shall apply to existing occupancies 
that will continue to be, or are proposed to be, in Groups A, B, E, F, M, R, Sand U. 
These provisions shall not apply to buildings with occupancies in Group H or I. 

40. Section 3412.3.2 is amended to read as follows: 

3410.3.2 Compliance with other codes. Buildings that are evaluated in accordance with 
this section shall comply with the International Fire Code 

41. Section 3412.4 is amended to read as follows: 

3412.4 Investigation and evaluation. For proposed work covered by this section, the 
building owner shall cause the existing building to be investigated and evaluated in 
accordance with the provisions of this section by a design professional licensed to 
practice in the State of Colorado. 

42. Section 3412.6 is amended to read as follows: 

30 



lllllro~.IIUt!P".a'¥1P~rH'"I'I~~~.~W.Ifll"lll",'lll''l. II II I 
Reception#: 821498 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
31 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

3412.6 Evaluation process. The building owner shall cause the existing building to be 
evaluated in accordance with the provisions of this section by a design professional( s) 
licensed to practice in the State of Colorado. The evaluation process specified herein 
shall be followed in its entirety to evaluate existing buildings. Table 3412.7 shall be 
utilized for tabulating the results of the evaluation. References to other sections of this 
code indicate that compliance with those sections is required in order to gain credit in 
the evaluation herein outlined. In applying this section to a building with mixed 
occupancies, where the separation between the mixed occupancies does not qualify for 
any category indicated in Section 3412.6.16, the score for each occupancy shall be 
determined and the lower score determined for each section of the evaluation process 
shall apply to the entire building. · 

Where the separation between the mixed occupancies qualifies for any category 
indicated in Section 3412.6.16, the score for each occupancy shall apply to each portion 
of the building based on the occupancy of the space. 

The following Appendixes are adopted: 

Appendix G Flood-Resistant Construction 
Appendix I Patio Covers 
Appendix J Grading 

43. Section Jl 03.1 is amended to read as follows: 

Jl03.1 Permits required. Except as exempted in Section Jl 03.2, no grading shall be 
performed without first having obtained a permit from the Garfield County Building and 
Planning Department or designee. A grading pennit does not include the construction 
of retaining walls or other structures. Security deposits in a form and amount approved 
by the Building Official or designee, based upon recommendations from the County 
Vegetation Management Office and the county's designated engineer shall be 
established prior to issuance of any major grading permits. 

44. Section Jl03.2 (I.) is amended to read as follows: 

1. Grading, excavation and earthwork construction, including fills and embankments 
that are constructed solely for agricultural purposes on lands that are farms or ranches. 

45. Section Jl 03.2 is amended to add an gth exemption from permit as follows: 

8. Grading that does not exceed 50 cubic yards of earthwork material or 6000 square 
feet of graded area whichever is greater. 

IV. 2009 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE (I.M.C.) 

A. Additions and Modifications: The Sections of the I.M.C. are adopted subject to the 

31 



Ill/ MY'o~.I~P'J¥1mr,w.111111 1M MM.I.fo:IIW'~M'~,~ IIIII 
Receptionij: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
32 af 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.90 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

following additions or modifications: 

I. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: 

101.1 Title This code shall be known as the Mechanical Code of Garfield County, 
Colorado. This code shall apply to all of the unincorporated area of Garfield County, 
Colorado. 

2. Section 103.2 is amended to read as follows: 

103.2 BUILDING OFFICIAL. The building official is hereby authorized and 
directed to enforce all of the provisions of this code; however, a guarantee that all 
buildings and structures have been constructed in accordance with all of the provisions 
ofthis code is neither intended nor implied. 

3. Section 103.4 is amended to read as follows: 

103.4 Liability. The adoption of this code, and any previous codes adopted by 
Garfield County, shall not be deemed to give rise to a duty of care on the part of any 
public entity, public employee or agent, nor shall this code or any previous codes be 
deemed to create any civil remedy against a public entity, public employee or agent. 
The code official, officer or employee charged with the enforcement of this code, while 
acting for the jurisdiction, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally, and is hereby 
relieved from personal liability for any damages accruing to persons or property as a 
result of any act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties. 
Any suit instituted against an officer or employee because of an act performed by that 
officer or employee in the lawful discharge of duties under the provisions of this code 
shall be defended by the legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final 
termination ofthe proceedings. The code official or any subordinate shall not be liable 
for cost in any action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions 
of this code; and any officer of the department of mechanical inspection, acting in good 
faith, shall be free from liability for acts performed under any of its provisions or by 
reason of any act or omission in the performance of official duties in connection 
therewith. 

4. Section 104 is amended to delete Sec. 104.2. Mechanical permits are not required in 
Garfield County. Mechanical inspections are part of the general building permit 
process. 

5. Section 106 Permits is deleted. Separate mechanical permits are not required in 
Garfield County. Mechanical inspections are part of the general building permit 
process. 

6. Section 107.2 is amended to read as follows: 

32 



1111 Al'l'o~ollftl"lii~~ilo~lltrt~~IICWI-m"IW'.:*•i IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07118/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean Alberico 
33 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

107.2 Required inspections aud testing. lt shall be the duty of the person doing the 
work, the owner, contractor or subcontractor to know that the building or structure has a 
valid permit and to notify the building department when work is ready for inspection. 
Upon conviction, a fine will be assessed to the person doing the work, the owner, 
contractor or subcontractor if work is being done without a permit and the inspection is 
not requested per Section l 07. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, the 
owner, contractor or subcontractor requesting any inspections required by this code to 
provide access and means for inspection of such work. Such request for inspection may 
be in writing or by calling the 24 hour automated telephone answering system. 

l. Underground inspection shall be made after trenches or ditches are 
excavated and bedded, piping installed, and before backfill is put in place. When 

excavated soil contains rocks, broken concrete, frozen chunks and other rubble that 
would damage or break the piping or cause corrosive action, clean backfill shall be on 
the job site. 

2. Rough-in inspection shall be made after the roof, framing, fire blocking and bracing 
are in place. and all ducting and other components to be concealed are complete, and 
prior to the installation of wall or ceiling membranes. 

3. Final inspection shall be made upon completion of the mechanical system. 

Exception: Ground-source heat pump loop systems tested in accordance with Section 
1208.1.1 shall be permitted to be backfilled prior to inspection. 

The requirements of this section shall not be considered to prohibit the operation of any 
heating equipment or appliances installed to replace existing heating equipment or 
appliances serving an occupied portion of a structure provided that a request for 
inspection of such heating equipment or appliances has been filed with the department 
not more than 48 hours after such replacement work is completed, and before any 
portion of such equipment or appliances is concealed by any permanent portion of the 
structure. 

7. Section 108.1 is amended to read as follows: 

108.1 Unlawful acts. Any person as defmed herein (Section 202) who erects, 
constructs, reconstructs, remodels, enlarges, alters, repairs, moves, improves, converts, 
demolishes, equips, uses, occupies, or maintains any building or structure, or any part of 
a building or structure, in the unincorporated area of Garfield county or causes the same 
to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provisions of this code, or any provisions 
of Part 2, Article 28, Title 30, C.R.S., 1973, as amended shall be deemed guilty of a 
misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof, shall be fined not more than $100.00, or by 
imprisonment in the county jail for not more than ten days, or both by such fine and 
imprisonment. Each and every day during which such illegal erection, construction, 
reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, improvement, 

33 



1111 W.~ol"'l".l'¥1~~111\'.lj~p"' ~~~lt~ll'f.iw,i\'1';~,~ IIIII 
Reception#: 821498 
07f1g/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alb•rico 
34 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

conversion, 
demolition, maintenance or use continues shall be deemed a separate offense. In case 
any building or structure is or is proposed to be erected, constructed, reconstructed, 
enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, converted, demolished, maintained or 
used in violation of this code or of any provision of Part 2, Article 28, Title 30, C.R.S., 
as amended, the District Attorney of the District, The Board of County Commissioners 
of Garfield County, or any owner of real estate within the area subject to this code, in 
addition to other remedies provided by law, may institute an appropriate action for 
injunction, mandamus or abatement to prevent, enjoin, abate, or remove such unlawful 
erection, construction, reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, 
improvement, conversion, demolition, maintenance . 

8. Section 108.4 is hereby repealed in its entirety. See IBC for penalties. 

9. Section 109 is hereby repealed in its entirety. See IBC for the appeal process. 

10. Section 202 is amended by adding the following definition within th.e alphabetical order · 
of the existing definitions. 

FIRE DEPARTMENT OFFICIAL. The chief officer of any of the fire protection 
districts in unincorporated Garfield County or the chief officer's authorized 
representative. 

PERSON. A natural person or any individual, partnership, corporation, association, 
company or other public or corporate body, including the federal government, and 
includes any political subdivision, agency, instrumentality, or corporation of the state or 
the United States government. Singular includes plural, male includes female. 

11. Section 303 is amended by adding a subsection: 

303.9 LPG Appliances. Appliances burning LPG (Liquid Petroleum Gas) shall not be 
installed in a pit basement or similar location where heavier-than-air gases may collect 
unless such location is provided with an approved means for removal of unburned gas. 
The policy of Garfield County is as follows: 

a. An untrapped drain with aminimum diameter of 4 inches located in the lowest area 
where heavier than air vapors may collect is to be run with a continuous slope to an exterior 
area, which is not within a depression or recessed below adjacent terrain. 

b. The area of termination is to be determined by the building inspector as likely to 
remain free of standing water, ice and other debris that may prevent the flow and 
dissipation of unburned gas. 

34 



Ill I W.1. IIIA!P".a'¥111'Hit'I'I~IN ~~ ,lil);'l'l'l"'IW'~;IK•~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 09:29:44 AM Jean Alberico 
35 of 46 Rec Fee:$0.00 Coo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

c. The upper inlet and the termination of the drain are to be provided with protection 
from the entry of debris or animals, which may cause blockage of the drain. Thls protection 
is to be approved by the building inspector. 

12. Section 509.1 is amended to read as follows: 

509.1 Where required. Commercial food heat-producing appliances required by 
Section 507.2.1 to have a Type I hood shall be provided with an approved automatic fire 
suppression system complying with the International Building Code and the 
International Fire Code. All fire suppression systems required by this code shall be 
inspected and approved by an inspector. The inspector shall be an authorized 
representative of the Fire Department Official or another qualified individual with prior 
approval of the Building Official. 

13. Section 805 is amended by adding a new section to read as follows: 

805.7 Factory-built chimneys shall be effectively fire blocked within any chase at each 
floor-ceiling level and at the roof. The vertical distance between adjacent frre blocking 
shall not exceed 10 feet. See me for additional requirements. 

14. Section 903.3 is amended to read as follows: 

903.3 Unvented gas log beater. Unvented gas log heaters are prohlbited. 

V. 2009 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE (I.P.C.) 

A. Additions and Modifications: The Sections of the I.P.C. are adopted subject to the 
following additions or modifications: 

1. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: 

101.1 Title. Thls code shall be known as the Plumbing Code of Garfield County, 
Colorado. This code shall apply to all of the unincorporated area of Garfield County, 
Colorado. 

2. Section 101.3 is amended to read as follows: 

101.3 Intent. The purpose of this code is to provide minimum standards to safeguard 
life or limb, health, property and public welfare by regulating and controlling the design, 
construction, installation, quality of materials, location, operation and maintenance or 
use of plumbing equipment and systems. The intent of this code is to meet or exceed 
the requirements of the state of Colorado plumbing code. When technical requirements, 
specifications or standards in the Colorado plumbing code conflict with thls code, the 
more restrictive shall apply. 

35 



II II fro~ollfltli"..,IWil~r,lt~.llt~lti':W.IWIR'IH"I. IIIII 
ReceptionU; 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean Alberico 
36 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

3. Section 103.2 is amended to read as follows: 

103.2 BUILDING OFFICIAL. The Building Official is hereby authorized and 
directed to enforce all of the provisions of this code; however, a guarantee that all 
buildings and structures have been constructed in accordance with all of the provisions 
of this code is neither intended nor implied. 

4. Section 103.4 is amended to read as follows: 

103.4 Liability. The adoption of this code, and any previous codes adopted by Garfield 
county, shall not be deemed to give rise to a duty of care on the part of any public entity, 
public employee or agent, nor shall this code or any previous codes be deemed to create 
any civil remedy against a public entity, public employee or agent. The code official, 
officer or employee charged with the enforcement of this code, while acting for the 
jurisdiction, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally, and is hereby relieved from 
personal liability for any damages accruing to persons or property as a result of any act 
or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit instituted 
against an officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or employee 
in the lawful discharge of duties under the provisions of this code shall be defended by 
the legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the proceedings. 
The code official or any subordinate shall not be liable for cost in any action, suit or 

proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of this code; and any officer 
of the department of mechanical inspection, acting in good faith, shall be free from 
liability for acts performed under any of its provisions or by reason of any act or 
omission in the performance of official duties in connection therewith. 

5. Section 104.2 is deleted. Garfield County does not require separate plumbing permits. 
Plumbing permits are part of the general building permit process. 

6. Section 106.1 is deleted. Garfield County does not require separate plumbing permits. 
Other subsections of Section I 06 apply only if not covered in the IBC. 

7. Section I 07.2 is amended to read as follows: 

107.2 Required inspections and testing. It shall be the duty of the person doing the 
work, the owner, contractor or subcontractor to know that the building or structure has a 
valid permit and to notify the building department when work is ready for inspection. 
Upon conviction, a fine will be assessed to the person doing the work, the owner, 
contractor or subcontractor if work is being done without a permit and the inspection is 
not requested per section I 07. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, the 
owner, contractor or subcontractor requesting any inspections required by this code to 
provide access and means for inspection of such work. All inspections requested prior 
to 3:00p.m. will be performed the following working day. Such request for inspection 
may be in writing or by calling the 24 hour automated telephone answering system. 

36 



1111 Wi\".1. IIIIIIII'.I'¥1DP,W! !Hr.M II'J~III'I"W~M~·I IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2812 08:28:44 RM Jean Alberico 
37 of 46 Rao Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 G~RFIELD COUNTY CO 

I. Underground inspection shall be made after trenches or ditches are 
excavated and bedded, piping installed, and before backfill is put in place. When 
excavated soil contains rocks, broken concrete, frozen chunks and other rubble that 
would damage or break the piping or cause corrosive action, clean backfill shall be on 
the job site. 

2. Rough-in inspection shall be made after the roof, framing, fire blocking, fire 
stopping, draft stopping and bracing is in place and all sanitary, storm and water 
distribution piping is roughed-in, and prior to the installation of wall or ceiling 
membranes. 

3. Final inspection shall be made after the building is complete, all plumbing 
fixtures are in place and properly connected, and the structure is ready for occupancy. 

8. Section I 08.1 is amended to read as follows: 

108.1 Unlawful acts. Any person as defined herein (section 202) who erects, . 
constructs, reconstructs, remodels, enlarges, alters, repairs, moves, improves, converts, 
demolishes, equips, uses, occupies, or maintains any building or structure, or any part of 
a building or structure, in the unincorporated area of Garfield County or causes the same 
to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provisions of this code, or any provisions 
ofP ART 2, Article 28, Title 30, C.R.S., 1973, as amended shall be deemed guilty of a 
misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof, shall be fined not more than $100.00, or by 
imprisonment in the county jail for not more than ten days or both by such fine and 
imprisonment. Each and every day during which such illegal erection, construction, 
reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, improvement, 
conversion, demolition, maintenance or use continues shall be deemed a separate 
offense. In case any building or structure is or is proposed to be erected, constructed, 
reconstructed, enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, converted, demolished, 
maintained or used in violation of this code or any provision of Part 2, Article 28, Title 
30, C.R.S., as amended, the District Attorney of the District, The Board of County 
Commissioners of Garfield County, or any owner of real estate within the area subject 
to this code, in addition to other remedies provided by law, may institute an appropriate 
action for injunction, mandamus or abatement to prevent, enjoin, abate, or remove such 
unlawful erection, construction, reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, 
move, improvement, conversion, demolition, maintenance or use. 

9. Section 108.4 Violation penalties is hereby repealed in its entirety. See the IBC for 
penalties. 

I 0. Section 109 is hereby repealed in its entirety. See IBC for appeal process. 

11. Section 202 is amended by adding the following definition within the alphabetical order 
of the existing definitions. 

37 



~~~~!tJ!J~"!~~!iW '""lll~.lwlll.:l.frlo!~ln'*'lll II I 
07/19/2012 09:28:44 AM J•~n ~lberico 
3B of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

FIRE DEPARTMENT OFFICIAL. The chief officer of any fire district in 
unincorporated Garfield County fire, or the chief officer's authorized representative. 

PERSON. A natural person or any individual, partnership, corporation, association, 
company or other public or corporate body, including the federal govermnent, and 
includes any political subdivision, agency, instrumentality, or corporation of the state or 
the United States govermnent. Singular includes plural, male includes female. 

12. Section 305.6.1 is amended to read as follows: 

305.6.1 Sewer depth. Building sewers that connect to private sewage disposal systems 
shall be a minimum of 12 inches below finished grade at the point of septic tank 
connection. Building sewers shall be a minimum of 18 inches below grade. 

13. Section 701.2 is amended to read as follows: 

701.2 Sewer required. Every building in which plumbing fixtures are installed and all 
premises having drainage piping shall be connected to a public sewer, where available, 
or an approved private sewage disposal system in accordance with the Guidelines On 
Individual Sewage Disposal Systems as published by the Colorado Department of Public 
Health and Environment, Water Quality Control Division. 

14. Section 904.1 is amended to read as follows: 

904.1 Roof extension. All open vent pipes that extend through a roof shall be 
terminated at least 12 inches above the roof, except that where a roof is to be used for 
any purpose other than weather protection, the vent extensions shall be run at least 7 
feet above the roof. 

15. Section 1106.1 is amended to read as follows: 

1106.1 General. The size of the vertical conductors and leaders. building storm drains, 
building storm sewers, and any horizontal branches of such drains or sewers shall be 
based on the 1 00-year hourly rainfall of two inches per hour. 

16. Section 1108.1 is amended to read as follows: 

1108.1 Combination drains and sewers. Combination sanitary and storm drains or 
sewers are prohibited. 

VI. 2009 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE (I.F.G.C.) 

A. Additions and Modifications: The Sections of the I.F.G.C. are adopted subject to the 

38 



•IIIIWllo l'lll'II'".Hi~IIW'!I' liMo IMI'IW"fflf.I\W'VIIII''~'i IIIII 
Reception#: 821498 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
39 of 4S Rec Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

following additions or modifications: 

I. Section I 01.1 is amended to read as follows: 

101.1 Title. This code shall be known as the Fuel Gas Code of Garfield County, 
Colorado. This code shall apply to all of the unincorporated area of Garfield County, 
Colorado. 

2. Section I 03.2 is amended to read as follows: 

103.2 BUILDING OFFICIAL. The Building Official is hereby authorized and 
directed to enforce all of the provisions of this code; however, a guarantee that all 
buildings and structures have been constructed in accordance with all of the provisions 
of this code is neither intended nor implied. 

3. Section 103.4 is amended to read as follows: 

103.4 Liability. The adoption ofthls code, and any previous codes adopted by Garfield 
County, shall not be deemed to give rise to a duty of care on the part of any public 
entity, public employee or agent, nor shall this code or any previous codes be deemed to 
create any civil remedy against a public entity, public employee or agent. The code 
official, officer or employee charged with the enforcement of this code, while acting for 
the jurisdiction, shall not thereby be rendered liable personally, and is hereby relieved 
from personal liability for any damages accruing to persons or property as a result of any 
act or by reason of an act or omission in the discharge of official duties. Any suit 
instituted against an officer or employee because of an act performed by that officer or 
employee in the lawful discharge of duties under the provisions of this code shall be 
defended by the legal representative of the jurisdiction until the final termination of the 
proceedings. The code official or any subordinate shall not be liable for cost in any 
action, suit or proceeding that is instituted in pursuance of the provisions of this code; 
and any officer of the department of mechanical inspection, acting in good faith, shall be 
free from liability for acts performed under any of its provisions or by reason of any act 
or omission in the performance of official duties in connection therewith. 

4. Section 104.2 is deleted. Garfield County does not require separate fuel gas permits. 
All permits are included with the building permit. 

5. Section 106.1 is deleted. Garfield County does not require separate fuel gas permits. 
Fuel gas requirements are reviewed as part of the building permit. Other subsections in 
I 06 not covered in the IBC apply. 

6. Section 107 .I is amended to read as follows: 

107.1 Required inspections and testing. It shall be the duty of the person doing the 
work, the owner, contractor or subcontractor to know that the building or structure has a 

39 



•m ftl'oloi'V"r.'ll~ rl 1"11~ lrrlU'IIII!Pirlll'iii"WO;Ifll.''"''l IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/1812012 08:28:44 AM Jean Albe~ioo 
40 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

valid permit and to notifY the building department when work is ready for inspection. 
Upon conviction, a fine will be assessed to the person doing the work, the owner, 
contractor or subcontractor if work is being done without a permit and the inspection is 
not requested per Section 107. It shall be the duty of the person doing the work, the 
owner, contractor or subcontractor requesting any inspections required by this code to 
provide access and means for inspection of such work. Such request for inspection may 
be in writing or by calling the 24 hour automated telephone answering system. 

Underground inspection shall be made after trenches or ditches are 
excavated and bedded, piping installed, and before backfill is put in place. When 
excavated soil contains rocks, broken concrete, frozen chunks and other rubble that 
would damage or break the piping or cause corrosive action, clean backfill shall be on 
the job site. 

Rough-in inspection shall be made after the roof, framing, fire blocking and bracing are 
in place and components to be concealed are complete, and prior to the installation of 
wall or ceiling membranes. 

Final inspection shall be made upon completion of the installation. The requirements of 
this section shall not be considered to prohibit the operation of any heating equipment 
installed to replace existing heating equipment serving an occupied portion of a 
structure in the event a request for inspection of such heating equipment has been filed 
with the department not more than 48 hours after replacement work is completed, and 
before any portion of such equipment is concealed by any permanent portion of the 
structure. 

7. Section 108.1 is amended to read as follows: 

108.1 Unlawful acts. Any person as defined herein (Section 202) who erects, 
constructs, reconstructs, remodels, enlarges, alters, repairs, moves, improves, converts, 
demolishes, equips, uses, occupies, or maintains any building or structure, or any part of 
a building or structure, in the unincorporated area of Garfield County or causes the same 
to be done, contrary to or in violation of any provisions of this code, or any provisions 
of Part 2, Article 28, Title 30, C.R.S., 1973, as amended shall be deemed guilty of a 
misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof, shall be fined not more than $100.00, or by 
imprisomnent in the county jail for not more than ten days, or both by such fine and 
imprisonment. Each and every day during which such illegal erection, construction, 
reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, improvement, 
conversion, 
demolition, maintenance or use continues shall be deemed a separate offense. In case 
any building or structure is or is proposed to be erected, constructed, reconstructed, 
enlarged, altered, repaired, moved, improved, converted, demolished, maintained or 
used in violation of this code or of any provision of Part 2, Article 28, Title 30, C.R.S., 
as amended, the District Attorney of the District, The Board of County Commissioners 
of Garfield County, or any owner of real estate within the area subject to this code, in 

40 



II II ftl\"o~. ~~P".a'¥iiii'II'IIIH:It~.lfll~ ilw.W~LIMI'~·~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean Alberico 
41 of 46 Rae Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

addition to other remedies provided by law, may institute an appropriate action for 
injunction, mandamus or abatement to prevent, enjoin, abate, or remove such unlawful 
erection, construction, reconstruction, remodel, enlargement, alteration, repair, move, 
improvement, conversion, demolition, maintenance or use. 

8. Section 108.4 is hereby repealed in its entirety. Penalties are assessed as per the me 

9. Section 109 is repealed in it entirety. See illC for appeal process. 

Section 202 is amended by adding the following definition within the alphabetical order 
of the existing definitions. 

FIRE DEPARTMENT OFFICIAL. The chief officer of any fire district in 
unincorporated Garfield fire protection districts or the chief officer's authorized 
representative. 

PERSON. A natural person or any individual, partnership, corporation, association, 
company or other public or corporate body, including the federal government, and 
includes any political subdivision, agency, instrumentality, or corporation of the state or 
the United States government. Singular includes plural, male includes female. 

10. Section 303.3 is amended to delete listed items 3 and 4 relating to unvented room 
heaters. Unvented room heaters are prohibited in Garfield County. 

11. Section 303 is amended to add a subsection. 

303.8 LPG Appliances. Appliances burning LPG (Liquid Petroleum Gas) shall not be 
installed in a pit, basement or similar location where heavier-than-air gases may collect 
unless such location is provided with an approved means for removal of unburned gas. 
The policy in Garfield County to approve such a means is as follows: 

An untrapped drain with a minimum diameter of 4 inches located in the lowest area 
where heavier-than-air vapors may collect is to be run with a continuous slope to an 
exterior area, which is not within a depression or recessed below adjacent terrain. 

The area of termination is to be determined by the building inspector as likely to remain 
free of standing water, ice and other debris that may prevent the flow and dissipation of 
unburned gas. 

The upper inlet and the termination of the drain are to be provided with protection from 
the entry of debris or auimals, which may cause blockage of the drain. This protection 
is to be approved by the building inspector. 

12. Section 403.4.2 is amended to add the following: 

41 



•111 ~I' rlr I'Unr•f!W\1111"1'~/'"o'r.ll!ll! II!JI. lf'l.l'll'l/'1'1\iln''l •1 II I 
Rvception"; 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
42 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

403.4.2 Steel. Steel and wrought-iron pipe shall be at least of standard weight (schedule 
40) and shall comply with one of the following standards: 

1. ASME B 36.10,10M 
2. ASTM A53: or 
3. ASTMA 106. 

Galvanized pipe shall not be used with propane. 

13. Section 406.4.1 is amended to read as follows: 

406.4.1 Test pressure. The test pressure to be used shall be no less than 1-112 
times the proposed maximuro working pressure, but not less than I 0 psig 
irrespective of design pressure. Where the test pressure exceeds 125 psig, the 
test pressure shall not exceed a value that produces a hoop stress in the piping 
greater than 50 percent of the specified minimuro yield strength of the pipe. 

14. Section 501.8 is amended to read as follows: 

501.8 Equipment not required to be vented. The following appliances shall not be 
required to be vented. 

1. Ranges. 
2. Built in domestic cooking units listed and marked for optional venting. 
3. Hot plates and laundry stoves. 
4. Type 1 clothes dryers (Type 1 clothes dryers shall be exhausted in accordance with 
the requirements of Section 614). 
5. A single booster type instantaneous water heater, where designed and used solely for 
the sanitizing rinse requirements of a dishwashing machine, provided that the heater is 
installed in a commercial kitchen having a mechanical exhaust system. Where installed 
in this manner, the draft hood, if required, shall be in place and uoaltered and the draft 
hood outlet shall not be less than 36 inches vertically and 6 inches horizontally from any 
surface other than the heater. 
6. Refrigerators. 
7. Counter appliances. 
8. Direct-fire make-up air heaters. 
9. Other equipment listed for unvented use and not provided with a flue collar. 
10. Specialized equipment of limited input such as laboratory burners and gas lights. 

Where the appliances and equipment listed in items 5 through 10 above are installed so 
that the aggregate input rating exceeds 20 Btu per hour per cubic foot of voluroe of the 
room or space in which such appliances and equipment are installed, one or more shall 
be provided with venting systems or other approved means for conveying the vent gases 
to the outdoor atmosphere so that the aggregate input rating of the remaining unvented 
appliances and equipment does not exceed the 20 Btu per hour per cubic foot figure. 

42 



•m ~"" lllll'".nl~lf'.IWif.lft'l. IM!Nr.W~IIm'~,~ IIIII 
Reeeptlon~: 821496 
07/1B/2012 09:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
43 of 46 R•o Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

Where the room or space in which the equipment is installed is directly connected to 
another room or space by a doorway, archway, or other opening of comparable size that 
cannot be closed, the volume of such adjacent room or space shall be permitted to be 
included in the calculations. 

15. Section 506 is amended by adding a new subsection to read as follows: 

506.4 Factory-built chimney enclosures. Factory-built chimneys shall be effectively 
fire blocked at each floor level and ceiling level and at the roo£ The vertical distance 
between adjacent fire blocking shall not exceed I 0 feet. See mechanical code for other 
requirements. 

16. Section 603.1 is amended to read as follows: 

603.1 General. Log lighters are prohibited. 

17. Section 621 is amended to read as follows: 

SECTION 621 UNVENTED ROOM HEATERS 

621.1 Prohibited installation. Installation ofunvented room heaters and unvented log 
heaters is prohibited. 

VII. 2009 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CONSERVATION CODE (IECC) 

. A. Additions and Modifications: The Sections of the IECC are adopted subject to the following 
additions or modifications: 

I. Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows: 

101.1 Title. This code shall be known as the International Energy Conservation Code 
of Garfield County, Colorado. This code shall apply to all of the unincorporated area of 
Garfield County, Colorado. 

2. Section 101.4.4 is deleted. 

3. Section 104 is deleted. See IRC Section R109 or me 110 as it applies 
for requirements related to inspections. 

4. Section 107 is deleted. Fees required will be determined under Sections Rl08 IRC 
or Section I 09 me as it applies. 

5. Section 108 is deleted. Stop Work Order regulations are determined in Sections 
R114 of the IRC or 115 of the IBC as it applies. 

43 



1111 Wil'o~.IIM!~IIP~II'R MIM,Litlf:N!V~MI'~,~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 RM Jean ~lberico 
44 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

6. Section 109 is deleted. See sections Rl 12 IRC or I 13 ffiC for the appeal process. 

EXHIBIT B-BUILDING PERMIT FEES 

Total Valuation* Fee 
$1.00 to $500.00 $23.50 
$501.00 to $2000.00 $23.50 for the first $500.00 plus $3.05 for 

each additional $1,000.00, or fraction 
thereof, to and including $2000.00. 

$2001.00 to $25,000.00 $69.25 for the first $2000.00 plus $14.00 
for each additional $1,000.00, or fraction 
thereof, to and including $25000.00. 

$25,001.00 to $50,000.00 $391.25 for the first $25,000.00 plus 
$10.10 for each additional $1,000.00, or 
fraction thereof, to and including 
$50,000.00. 

$50,001.00 to $100,000.00 $643.75 for the first $50,000.00 plus $7.00 
for each additional $1,000.00, or fraction 
thereof, to and includinq $50,000.00. 

$100,001.00 to $500,000.00 $993.75 for the first $100,000.00 plus 
$5.60 for each additional $1,000.00, or 
fraction thereof, to and including 
$100,000.00. 

$500,001.00 to $1,000,000.00 $3233.75 for the first $500,000.00 plus 
$4.75 for each additional $1,000.00, or 
fraction thereof, to and including 
$500,000.00. 

$1,000,001.00 and up $5608.75 for the first $1,000,000.00 plus 
$3.15 for each additional $1,000.00, or 
fraction thereof. 

Plan Check fee shall be 65% of the building permit fee. 

* Based on Table 1 attached subject to change only by Garfield 
County Board of County Commissioners' action. 

Other rnspections and Fees: 
1. Inspections outside of normal business hours ......................................................... $50. 00/hr. 

(minimum charge-two hours) 
2. Reinspect ion fees .......................................................................................... $50. 00/hr. 
3. Inspections for which no fee is specifically indicated ....................... $50. 00/hr. 

(minimum charge - 1 hour) 
4. Additional plan review required by changes, additions or revisions to 

plans ..................... $ 50. 00/hr, 
(minimum charge - 1 hour) 

5. Grading Permits 
Major Grading- over 20,000 sq. ft. or over 5000 cu. Yd. 

····························· .$400.00 
Minor Grading -less than 20,000 sq. ft. or under 5000 cu. yd. 

················ ....... $100.00 
6. Manufactured Home Fee (single level) ............................. $400. 00 
7. Manufactured Home Fee (multi level) ................................... $600. 00 
8. Re-roofing Fee ............................................................................................... $100. 00 
9. Demo Permit ................................................................................................... , .$25.00 

44 



1111 lil".!.llftP"iM/~It-JLIMIIt.J,~~"r¥':M'~,~ IIIII 
Reception~: 821496 
07/19/2012 08:28:44 AM Jean Alberico 
45 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doo Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

TABLE.1 SQUARE FOOT CONSTRUCTION COSTS 

Grwp ~003 tntem.atlonsl 9U.lding Code lA 16 IIA 

Aletmbly, lhealm. """ - '160.G9 153.29 149.76 
.. 1 

AAefnbly. lheatem, withotrt stage 14U1 1<M2 1a7.48 

M ,...,bly, ni-bs 118.a4 . 115.03 112.14 

M A&Ambly, reata.Jrants, bars, banquet halls 117.34-. 1Wl3 110.14 -·- 149.88 142.27 138.~ 

.. 3 
Assembly, general, community hells, llbrlries, 
rooseum 11B.71 111.76 107.24 

, ... ,Assembly,, arenas 117.34 114.03 110.14 

B Business H9.8S 115.54 111.79 

E ·-- 12&37 124.05· 120-{iO 

F~1 Factmy and Industrial, moder'ate tlamd 74.13 7MB f.i6.42 

F·2 F.adQry and lndustriel, low hazard 73.13 ..... 68.42 

H-1 High Husld, .. p\o!ives 69.75 66.29 53.04 

H•2,-3,~ High hazard 69.76 ~29 6J.D4 ... HPM . 119.86 116.54 111.79 

1-1 btlttilonal, GUpli!lrvised envii'OMI9nt 119.19 115.10 112.01 

1-2 . klstltullohal.ln-led 200.36 196.04 192.30 

1-3 lnatllutlonal, resttalnad 137.99 133.67 129.93 

1-4 ~al.dayclilf\lfa.cllltie& 119.19 11~10 112.01 

M M~le 88.15 84.63 80.95 

R-1. Resfdtnltat; liotefs 120.33 116.24 11.3.15 

R-2 ResideMiel, fltiltiple family 160.33 56.24 ~-15 

R-3 Residan.ll@:~ one- and two-fllfri.ly 9c;,19 63.52 •91.22. 

R4 Resldentlaf, c;Y'I;l/assisterlllvlnq fat!UUes 11«19 115.10 112.01 

S·1 ~. moderale ha¥rd 6B.7S 65.29 61.04 

••• Sk!rave, 1ow hWd 67.75 &1.29 61.04 

u UI~ •. Mfscelan~s . 52.26 49.43 46.49 

Other Valuations: 

Garages and wood storage buildings 

Covered decks and patios 
Unfinished basements 
Foundations/crawlspaces 
Basement conversion unfin to fin 

45 

Type of Conl>\n..tetlon . 

1111 lilA 11\B r/. VA 

143.55 133.5Q 132.90 138.98 123.75 

131.28 121.31 120.63 126,71 111.47 

107.94 10~.98 99.75 104.00 91.98 

106.94 98.98 96.75 103,00 89.98 ' 

132.52 122.51 121.82 t27.96 112.0/ 

102.113 91.08 91.39 97.46 81.24 

106.94 IM.99 98.75 103.00 99.1M 

108.S6 es:1s 94~5. 102..31 84.79 

115.17 106.24 103.13 111>8 94.92 

$4..31$' 56.82 ... 51 51.75 47.42 

63~8 55.62 55.61 50.75 47.42 

59.97 82.43 52.42 57.30 44.23 .. ..., 52.43 52.42 57.36 44.23 

1~..!6 96.15 94~. 102.31 84.79 

107..47· 98.61 98.58~: .• 1o4:22 90.64 

187.D7 .176.32·, I'Ll'· co 162.81 164.98 

124.70 114.47 112.98 120M 104.12 

1117.47 8_8.61 IM.SS. 1114>22 00.84 

n.74 70.'26 . 70.o2 73.81 61.21; 

10aB1 suo 99.75. 105.41 ., ..... 
88.61 19.95 ~9.90 85.56 71.98 

86.71 84.51 94.30 87.22 60.46 

107A7 98.61 98.!6 104.22 90.64 

56.97 50.43 51M! ... 36 42.23 

'51.91 50.43 50,42 55,36 <= 
44.17 38.31 38,31 41.69 31.50 

$18.00 per sq.ft. 

$24.00 per sq.ft. 
41. 00 
9.00 

33. 68 

VB • 

119.25 

106.96 

69.94 

IJ7.94 

106.17 

77.74 

87.94 

81.61 

91,38 

45.06 

#.06 

N.P. 

40.80 

B1.li1 

8.7.06 

N.P. 

98.94 

87.D8 

59.22 

- 88:25 

68.40 

74 .... 

IJl'JlG 

39.88 

3B.m, 

29.99 



IIIIIY'".1. llfn!P"Ifl~rii\II'I,W!rllt/1. I.W'!IRI;I\W~Itt'\1, IIIII 
Reception#: 821496 
07/18/2012 08:28:44 ~M Jean ~lberioo 
46 of 46 Reo Fee:$0.00 Doc Fee:0.00 GARFIELD COUNTY CO 

Plan check fee basement conversion 
Decks 
Carports 
Underground pools 
Mini storage buildings 

46 

100.00/each 
12.00 per sq.ft. 
12.00 
20.00 
22.51 


